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      This District has received an application for a Department of the Army permit pursuant to 
Section 404 of the Clean Water Act (33 U.S.C. 1344). 
 
 The purpose of this notice is to solicit comments and recommendations from the public 
concerning issuance of a Department of the Army permit for the work described below. 
 
APPLICANT:  Pennsylvania Turnpike Commission  
     700 South Eisenhower Boulevard 
     Middletown, PA 17057 
 
AGENT:  A.D. Marble  
        2200 Renaissance Boulevard 
    Suite 260 
    King of Prussia, PA 19406 
 
WATERWAY:  East Branch of the Perkiomen Creek and Unnamed Tributaries, Indian Creek 
and Unnamed Tributaries, Unnamed Tributaries to the Skippack Creek, and Unnamed 
Tributaries to Ridge Valley Creek.  
 
LOCATION:  The project is located along 6.8 miles of the Northeast Extension of the 
Pennsylvania Turnpike, Interstate 476 (I-476), from milepost A31.3 (just south of Fretz Road) to 
A38.1 (just north of Clump Road), in Lower Salford, Salford, and Franconia Townships, 
Montgomery County, Pennsylvania.  From 40.272962°N Lat. and -75.358451°W Long., To 
40.343027°N Lat. and -75.387813 °W Long.  
  
ACTIVITY:  The applicant, The Pennsylvania Turnpike Commission (PTC) is proposing a total 
roadway reconstruction and widening of the Northeast Extension of the Pennsylvania Turnpike 
(I-476) from four to six travel lanes, from Milepost A31.3 to Milepost A38.1, in Lower Salford, 
Franconia, and Salford Townships, Montgomery County, Pennsylvania, as indicated on the 
attached plans E-1 to E-10.  In general, the overall project consists of widening the existing 
roadway, shoulders, and medians including the full depth reconstruction of the existing roadway, 
widening mainline bridges, and the replacement of overhead bridges, drainage, stormwater 
management, and side road adjustments. 
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 As stated above, the PTC proposes to widen I-476 from four to six travel lanes.  Specifically, 
the proposed work would involve mechanized land clearing operations of filling, grading, 
excavating, and vegetation clearing for; the extension of 16 existing roadway culverts, bridges, 
or pipes that would include the construction of new wing walls, the full replacement of 6 existing 
roadway culverts, the placement of rip-rap scour protection associated with the newly 
constructed culvert, bridge, or pipe extensions, cut and fill operations associated with side slope 
construction for roadway widening, the installation of stormwater management facilities, the 
construction of stormwater outfall structures and associated rip-rap, the permanent relocation of 
9 streams and/or waterways, the construction of temporary access roads, and the installation of 
temporary cofferdams and by-pass pumps associated with dewatering activities.  The above 
stated work is shown on the attached plans E-11 to E-36 (two sided).  Project impacts within 
aquatic resources (Streams and Wetlands) associated with the above mentioned work are 
described below.     
 
 Of the 39 streams/waterways located within the proposed project design area, 26 would be 
impacted due to project implementation.  Approximately 8,148 linear feet and/or 1.13 acre of 
stream channel, below the Ordinary High Water Mark would be permanently impacted by the 
roadway reconstruction and widening activities.  In addition, the proposed project would 
temporarily impact approximately 3,510 linear feet and/or 0.65 acre of stream channel, below 
the Ordinary High Water Mark.  The PTC has indicated that all temporary stream/waterway 
impacts (fills, structures, etc.) would be removed and then restored (grades, contours, vegetation) 
to pre-construction conditions upon completion of the work.  As stated above, the proposed 
project would impact a total of 8,148 linear feet of stream channel.  Of the total stream channel 
impact, 4,213 linear feet is associated with nine stream relocations, while 793 linear feet is 
associated with stream channel Loss that would require compensation for the unavoidable 
adverse impacts/affects to aquatic resources.  To avoid and minimize adverse impacts/affects 
within streams and/or waterways, the PTC proposes to relocate 9 stream channels within the 
project design area.  As shown on plans E-37 to E-39, the largest of the relocations occur within 
streams S-12 and S-13.  Approximately 2,219 linear feet of stream channel would be created 
using natural stream channel design.  The total of all stream channels relocated and/or created 
would be 4,383 linear feet.  As mentioned above, the reconstruction and widening of I-476 
would also impact Wetland resources within the project design area. 
 
 The PTC has identified Palustrine Open Water (POW), and Palustrine Emergent (PEM), 
Scrub-Shrub (PSS), and Forested (PFO) wetlands within the 6.8 miles of I-476 from milepost 
A31.3 to A38.1.  Of the 35 wetlands located within the proposed project design area, 16 would 
be impacted due to project implementation.  The proposed project would permanently impact 
and/or fill approximately 1.08 acre of PEM, 0.0008 acre of PSS, and 0.12 acre of PFO 
wetlands, for a total of 1.20 acre due to roadway reconstruction and widening activities.  In 
addition, the proposed project would temporarily impact and/or fill approximately 0.26 acre of 
PEM wetlands.  The PTC has indicated that all temporary wetland impacts (fills, structures, etc.) 
would be removed and then restored (grades, contours, vegetation) to pre-construction conditions 
upon completion of the work.  Furthermore, based on the information provided within the PTC’s 
application, indirect or secondary impacts to aquatic resources are not anticipated as a result of 
project implementation.  The PTC is providing Compensatory Mitigation for all unavoidable 
adverse impacts/affects, and/or the loss of aquatic resources associated with the I-476 roadway  
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reconstruction and widening activities.  A description of the proposed Compensatory Mitigation 
is provided below.           
 
PURPOSE:  The purpose of the project, as stated by the applicant, is to update the existing 
Northeast Extension, I-476 to meet current Department of Transportation and Federal Highway 
Administration standards to address current safety and traffic issues.   
 
 A preliminary review of this application indicates that the proposed work would not affect 
listed species or their critical habitat pursuant to Section 7 of the Endangered Species Act as 
amended.  As the evaluation of this application continues, additional information may become 
available which could modify this preliminary determination. 
 
 The decision whether to issue a permit will be based on an evaluation of the activity's 
probable impact including its cumulative impacts on the public interest.  The decision will reflect 
the national concern for both protection and utilization of important resources.  The benefits 
which reasonably may be expected to accrue from the work must be balanced against its 
reasonably foreseeable detriments.  All factors which may be relevant to the work will be 
considered including the cumulative effects thereof; among those are conservation, economics, 
aesthetics, general environmental concerns, wetlands, cultural values, fish and wildlife values, 
flood hazards, flood plain values, land use, navigation, shore erosion and accretion, recreation, 
water supply and conservation, water quality, energy needs, safety, food and fiber production, 
mineral needs and welfare of the people.  A Department of the Army permit will be granted 
unless the District Engineer determines that it would be contrary to the public interest. 
 
 The Corps of Engineers is soliciting comments from the public; Federal, State, and local 
agencies and officials; Indian Tribes; and other interested parties in order to consider and 
evaluate the impacts of this proposed activity.  Any comments received will be considered by the 
Corps of Engineers to determine whether to issue, modify, condition or deny a permit for this 
proposal.  To make this decision, comments are used to assess impacts on endangered species, 
historic properties, water quality, general environmental effects, and the other public interest 
factors listed above.  Comments are used in the preparation of an Environmental Assessment 
and/or an Environmental Impact Statement pursuant to the National Environmental Policy Act.  
Comments are also used to determine the need for a public hearing and to determine the overall 
public interest of the proposed activity. 
 
 Comments on the proposed work should be submitted, in writing, within 30 days to the 
District Engineer, U.S. Army Corps of Engineers (USACE), Philadelphia District, Wanamaker 
Building, 100 Penn Square East, Philadelphia, Pennsylvania 19107-3390. 
 
 The National Historic Preservation Act requires Federal agencies to identify and address 
potential affects to historic properties or archaeological resources.  The PTC has completed 
historic resource surveys along the entire 6.8 miles of the I-476 corridor from milepost A31.3 to 
A38.1 and/or within the proposed project design area.  The surveys have identified historic 
properties within the U.S. Army Corps of Engineers, Philadelphia District’s permit area, in 
accordance with 33 CFR Part 325, Appendix C.  At this time, further review and consultation is 
required in order for the USACE to meet its obligations under Section 106 of the National 
Historic Preservation Act.                       
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 Based on a review of the application, the PTC proposes to avoid and minimize impacts 
within streams/waterways and wetlands, and/or aquatic resources, to the maximum extent 
practicable, by designing the project to completely avoid aquatic resources, installing retaining 
walls, using steeper fill slopes (1.5 to 1), providing stream relocations to avoid piping/enclosing 
existing stream channels, depressing rip-rap to matching existing stream elevations, using open 
bottom culvert extensions, using protective fencing around wetlands, installing and working off 
of temporary timber matting within wetlands, including bio-retention and infiltration features for 
stormwater management facilities, and by using best management practices (BMP’s).  For all 
unavoidable Adverse Impacts/Affects, and/or Loss of aquatic resources (wetlands and streams), 
the PTC proposes the following Compensatory Mitigation described below.      
     
 To compensate for the unavoidable adverse impacts/affects, and/or the Loss of 1.20 acre of 
Palustrine wetlands and 793 linear feet of Riverine stream channel, the PTC has offered two 
candidate sites, as shown on plan E-40.  The proposed Wetland compensation site is identified 
as parcel number 34-000-01393-00-4, known as the Davidheiser Property, located at 443 
Creamery Road, in Telford, Pennsylvania, while the proposed Stream compensation site is 
identified as parcel number 34-00-02953-50-5, known as the Delp property, located at 715 Keller 
Creamery Road, in Telford, Pennsylvania.  The proposed wetland compensation site is located 
along the East Branch of the Perkiomen Creek.  Through the site selection process, the PTC has 
confirmed that the wetland compensation site was once part of the existing wetlands adjacent to 
the East Branch of the Perkiomen Creek.  Wetlands on the site were historically filled to create 
pasture land.  The PTC is required to provide approximately 1.32 acre of PEM (1.08 acre), PSS 
(0.0012 acre), and PFO (0.24 acre) wetland as compensation for project impacts.  The PTC 
proposes to remove the historic fill material and Re-establish approximately 2.03 acre of 
wetland within the proposed wetland boundary, as shown on plans E-41 to E-57.  The available 
acreage at the proposed compensation site provides an excess above the 1.32 acre required for 
wetland mitigation.  During the construction of the wetland compensation site, 0.21 acre of 
wetlands would be impacted, but incorporated as part of the overall 2.03 acre compensation site. 
The proposed Stream Compensation site is located within Indian Creek, a perennial tributary to 
the East Branch of the Perkiomen Creek.  The PTC propose to remove the existing Dam and 
Enhance and Rehabilitate 475 to 500 linear feet of the stream channel/Indian Creek 
immediately up-stream, as shown on plans E-58 to E-60.  The proposed dam removal would 
provide for the shift from a reservoir to a free flowing stream channel that would improve water 
quality, restore historic fish passage, and allow other organisms, that have been absent due to 
poor water quality, to repopulate the stream channel. 
                      
 At this time, the proposed compensation stated above is a Conceptual proposal.  As an 
evaluation of this application continues, additional information may become available which 
could modify this Compensation Proposal.     
 
 In accordance with Section 401 of the Clean Water Act, a Water Quality Certificate is 
necessary from the State government in which the work is located.  Any comments concerning 
the work described above which relate to Water Quality considerations should be sent to this 
office with a copy to the State. 
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 The evaluation of the impact of the work described above on the public interest will include 
application of the guidelines promulgated by the Administrator, U.S. Environmental Protection 
Agency, under authority of Section 404(b) of the Clean Water Act. 
 
 Any person may request, in writing, to the District Engineer, within the comment period 
specified in this notice, that a public hearing be held to consider this application.  Requests for a 
public hearing shall state in writing, with particularity, the reasons for holding a public hearing. 
 
 Additional information concerning this permit application may be obtained by calling 
Mr. Bryan P. Bellacima at (215) 656-6732, via email at bryan.p.bellacima@usace.army.mil, or 
writing this office at the above address. 
 
 
 
 
         Edward E. Bonner 
         Chief, Regulatory Branch  
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