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  This District has received an application for a Department of the Army permit pursuant to 
Section 10 of the Rivers and Harbors Act of 1899 (33 U.S.C. 403) and Section 404 of the Clean 
Water Act (33 U.S.C. 1344). 
 
  The purpose of this notice is to solicit comments and recommendations from the public 
concerning issuance of a Department of the Army permit for the work described below. 
 
APPLICANT:  Borough of Avalon 
 
AGENT:   Mott MacDonald 
                              833 Route 9 North 
                              P.O. Box 373 
                              Cape May Court House, New Jersey 08210 
 
WATERWAY: Gravens Thorofare 
 
LOCATION: Approximately 1800 feet south and west of the Gravens Thorofare crossing                               
Avalon Boulevard, identified as Lot 1, Block 121.01, in Middle Township, Cape May County, 
New Jersey 
 
ACTIVITY: On September 6, 2013, this office issued a verification of Nationwide Permits 16 
and 33 for A) the temporary construction of a 2156 linear foot temporary road through tidal 
marsh and navigable waters for the removal of dredged materials from the Borough’s confined 
disposal facility (CDF) site located on Macchia’s (Graven’s) Island and B) return water 
discharge associated with the removal of dredged materials.  The work included the following: 
A) discharge of approximately 2.17 acre of fill within tidal marsh for the 2156 feet of road 
construction; B) placement of a CDF outfall extending approximately 110 linear feet waterward 
of the mean high water line; C) a timber matted equipment access extending approximately 90 
feet waterward of the mean high water line of Graven’s Thorofare, and D) the discharge of return 
water from the CDF. The approval was conditioned to require the removal of all fill and 
structures in regulated areas (including fill in wetlands and structures waterward of the mean 
high water line) no later than February 8, 2015 with final restoration of all aquatic resources, 
including return of grades and final re-vegetation, to be completed no later than May 22, 2015.  
The approval was later modified on December 9, 2013 and October 24, 2014 to allow for revised 
impacts of a maximum of 2.035 acre of wetland fill and extension of time for complete removal 
and restoration of the road by June 15, 2016. It should also be noted that the project included  
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placement of four culverted crossings of small tidal streams waterward of the mean high water 
line. These crossings received advanced approval as temporary from the U.S. Coast Guard on 
October 13, 2013. 
 
On June 15, 2016, this office received an application from the Borough for the permanent 
maintenance of the road to the CDF. The applicant has also mentioned that it is the intent of the 
applicant that the road will be subject to inspection prior to future contracted use or specific 
project. As necessary there would be need for routine maintenance work on the road surface 
course to re-establish its thickness and width for safe use.  They also mention that such 
maintenance would be limited to the wetland fill approved on December 9, 2013 as described on 
the plans attached to this notice.  The applicant continues that further modification to the CDF is 
also proposed to create a ramp in both uplands and originally-approved road fill when access is 
required in order for vehicles to cross the CDF berm.   
 
PURPOSE: The applicant’s stated purpose to maintain the road in perpetuity is to allow for 
heavy equipment access to the CDF for removal of materials from the CDF and for pre-dredging 
preparation of the CDF.  
 
  This application for verification of Nationwide Permits 16 and 33 was reviewed under 
Section 7 of the Endangered Species Act. This office then determined that no species listed under 
the Endangered Species Act were likely to be affected by the project. As the work discussed 
herein includes no further regulated activities, a preliminary review indicates that the proposed 
work would not further affect listed species or their critical habitat pursuant to Section 7 of the 
Endangered Species Act as amended.  As the evaluation of this application continues, additional 
information may become available which could modify this preliminary determination. 
 
  The decision whether to issue a permit will be based on an evaluation of the activity's 
probable impact including its cumulative impacts on the public interest.  The decision will reflect 
the national concern for both protection and utilization of important resources.  The benefits 
which reasonably may be expected to accrue from the work must be balanced against its 
reasonably foreseeable detriments.  All factors which may be relevant to the work will be 
considered including the cumulative effects thereof; among those are conservation, economics, 
aesthetics, general environmental concerns, wetlands, cultural values, fish and wildlife values, 
flood hazards, flood plain values, land use, navigation, shore erosion and accretion, recreation, 
water supply and conservation, water quality, energy needs, safety, food and fiber production, 
mineral needs and welfare of the people.  A Department of the Army permit will be granted 
unless the District Engineer determines that it would be contrary to the public interest. 
 
  The Corps of Engineers is soliciting comments from the public; Federal, State, and local 
agencies and officials; Indian Tribes; and other interested parties in order to consider and 
evaluate the impacts of this proposed activity.  Any comments received will be considered by the 
Corps of Engineers to determine whether to issue, modify, condition or deny a permit for this 
proposal.  To make this decision, comments are used to assess impacts on endangered species, 
historic properties, water quality, general environmental effects, and the other public interest 
factors listed above.  Comments are used in the preparation of an Environmental Assessment 
and/or an Environmental Impact Statement pursuant to the National Environmental Policy Act.   
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Comments are also used to determine the need for a public hearing and to determine the overall 
public interest of the proposed activity. 
 
  Comments on the proposed work should be submitted, in writing, within 30 days to the 
District Engineer, U.S. Army Corps of Engineers, Philadelphia District, Wanamaker Building, 
100 Penn Square East, Philadelphia, Pennsylvania  19107-3390. 
 
          The original application for verification of Nationwide Permits 16 and 33 was reviewed 
under Section 106 of the National Historic Preservation Act. This office had determined that the 
project would have no potential to affect historic resources due to the limited scope of project.  
As no further regulated activity is proposed, this office maintains its original determination 
herein. 
 
 The Magnuson-Stevens Fishery Conservation and Management Act, as amended by the 
Sustainable Fisheries Act 1996 (Public Law 104-267), requires all Federal agencies to consult 
with the National Marine Fisheries Service on all actions, or proposed actions, permitted, funded, 
or undertaken by the agency that may adversely affect Essential Fish Habitat (EFH).  For the 
original nationwide permit verification, an assessment of the species listed in the "Guide to 
Essential Fish Habitat Designations in the Northeastern United States, Volume IV: New Jersey 
and Delaware", dated March 1999, specifically page 63, was performed. This office determined 
that there may be adverse effects to species of concern but such effects would not be substantial 
and so would not require conservation measures.  This was coordinated with NMFS on August 8, 
2013. As no further regulated activity is proposed, this office maintains its original determination 
herein. 
 
Compensatory mitigation:  The applicant has determined that the project would require 
mitigation to compensate for un-avoidable losses to wetlands. As such, the applicant proposes to 
purchase 2.2 credits from an approved mitigation bank 
 
  In accordance with Section 307(c) of the Coastal Zone Management Act of 1972, 
applicants for Federal Licenses or Permits to conduct an activity affecting land or water uses in a 
State's coastal zone must provide certification that the activity complies with the State's Coastal 
Zone Management Program.  The applicant has stated that the proposed activity complies with 
and will be conducted in a manner that is consistent with the approved State Coastal Zone 
Management (CZM) Program.  No permit will be issued until the State has concurred with the 
applicant's certification or has waived its right to do so.  Comments concerning the impact of the 
proposed and/or existing activity on the State's coastal zone should be sent to this office, with a 
copy to the State's Office of Coastal Zone Management. 
 
  In accordance with Section 401 of the Clean Water Act, a Water Quality Certificate is 
necessary from the State government in which the work is located.  Any comments concerning 
the work described above which relate to Water Quality considerations should be sent to this 
office with a copy to the State. 
 
  The evaluation of the impact of the work described above on the public interest will 
include application of the guidelines promulgated by the Administrator, U.S. Environmental 
Protection Agency, under authority of Section 404(b) of the Clean Water Act. 
 



- 4 - 
   
          Any person may request, in writing, to the District Engineer, within the comment period 
specified in this notice, that a public hearing be held to consider this application.  Requests for a 
public hearing shall state in writing, with particularity, the reasons for holding a public hearing. 
 
  Additional information concerning this permit application may be obtained by calling Mr. 
David J. Caplan  at 215-656-6731, via email at David.J.Caplan@usace.army.mil, or by writing to 
this office at the above address. 
 
 
 
 
            Samuel L. Reynolds 
 Acting Chief, Regulatory Branch 
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